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Unlocking the mystery of the lone woman from Island of the Blue Dolphins

While reading Island of the Blue Dolphins at school and learning about the real woman stranded on San
Nicolás Island, ten-year-old Tíshmal begins writing emails to "Miss Karana" in hopes of talking to her spirit.
When she arrived on the mainland of Southern California, Miss Karana spoke a language that no one could
understand even back then, and all that remains is a recording of the song she sang when she was found on
the island. Tíshmal realizes that some of the words sound very similar to Chamtéela (Luiseño), the language
spoken on her reservation. As she writes to Miss Karana, Tíshmal becomes more and more resolved to
understand the lone woman's song.

The only person able to help her is a grouchy great uncle, Wéh Powéeya ("two tongues"), the last living
person fluent in the language of their ancestors from the belly button of the ocean: the islands including San
Nicolás. Together, Tíshmal and Wéh Powéeya must discover what the lone woman said long ago in order to
help her spirit finish the journey West.

Developed in accordance with fourth grade Common Core State Standards, Dear Miss Karana tells a
compelling story of family, determination, and cultural perseverance.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Sullivan:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people
in the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above.
Every person has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Dear Miss Karana. All
type of book could you see on many options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Adam Schneider:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title Dear Miss Karana
suitable to you? The actual book was written by well known writer in this era. The particular book untitled
Dear Miss Karanais one of several books that will everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired many
people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever know just before.
The author explained their plan in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to know the core of this
book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world with this book.

Christopher Gaul:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its protect may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer can be Dear Miss Karana why because the excellent cover that make
you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the
outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Erik Hilyard:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This publication Dear Miss Karana was filled with regards to science. Spend
your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has distinct feel when
they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a
book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book you wanted.
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