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Colloquial Yoruba: The Complete Course for Beginners has been carefully developed by an experienced
teacher to provide a step-by-step course to Yoruba as it is written and spoken today.

Combining a clear, practical and accessible style with a methodical and thorough treatment of the language,
it equips learners with the essential skills needed to communicate confidently and effectively in Yoruba in a
broad range of situations. No prior knowledge of the language is required.

Colloquial Yoruba is exceptional; each unit presents a wealth of grammatical points that are reinforced with
a wide range of exercises for regular practice. A full answer key, a grammar summary, bilingual glossaries
and English translations of dialogues can be found at the back as well as useful vocabulary lists throughout.

Key features include:

A clear, user-friendly format designed to help learners progressively build up their speaking, listening,●

reading and writing skills

Jargon-free, succinct and clearly structured explanations of grammar●

An extensive range of focused and dynamic supportive exercises●

Realistic and entertaining dialogues covering a broad variety of narrative situations●

Helpful cultural points explaining the customs and features of life in Nigeria●

An overview of the sounds of Yoruba●



Balanced, comprehensive and rewarding, Colloquial Yoruba is an indispensable resource both for
independent learners and students taking courses in Yoruba.

Audio material to accompany the course is available to download free in MP3 format from
www.routledge.com/cw/colloquials. Recorded by native speakers, the audio material features the dialogues
and texts from the book and will help develop your listening and pronunciation skills.
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From reader reviews:

Regina Rodgers:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Colloquial Yoruba: The
Complete Course for Beginners (Colloquial S). All type of book would you see on many resources. You can
look for the internet methods or other social media.

Steve Diaz:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of
you maybe may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Colloquial Yoruba: The
Complete Course for Beginners (Colloquial S) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world.
Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Charles Buffington:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find book that need more time
to be read. Colloquial Yoruba: The Complete Course for Beginners (Colloquial S) can be your answer
because it can be read by anyone who have those short free time problems.

Robert Burmeister:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every
year had been exactly added. This book Colloquial Yoruba: The Complete Course for Beginners (Colloquial
S) was filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science
competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading the book. If you know how big good thing
about a book, you can experience enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get
book that you wanted.
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