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The only piece of information that Summer Davis takes away from her years at Peninsula Upper School --
one of the finest in the Brooklyn Heights-to-Park Slope radius, to quote the promotional materials -- is the
concept that DNA defines who we are and forever ties us to our relatives. A loner by circumstance, a social
outcast by nature, and a witty and warm narrator of her own unimaginable chaos by happenstance, Summer
hangs on to her interest in genetics like a life raft, in an adolescence marked by absence: her beautiful, aloof
mother abandons the family without a trace; her father descends into mental illness, haunted by a lifelong
burning secret and abetted by a series of letters that he writes to make sense of his feelings; her best friend
Claire drifts out of Summer's life in a breeze of indifference, feigned on both sides; and her older brother
fluctuates between irrational fury and unpredictable tenderness in an inaccessible world of his making.

Uncertain of her path and unbalanced by conflicting impulses toward hope and escape, Summer stays close
to her father while attending college, taking him to electro-shock therapy treatments and trying to make sense
of his inscrutable past. Upon his departure for a new and possibly recovered life, Summer begins to question
the role of genetics and whether she is destined to live out her family's legacy of despair. But it is only when
Summer decides to leave New York herself and put off a promising science career to take care of her great-
aunt Stella -- bedrock of the family and bastion of folksy wisdom, irreverent insight, and Sinatra
memorabilia in a less-than-scenic part of the Pennsylvanian countryside -- that Summer begins to learn that
her biography doesn't have to define her...and that her future, like her DNA, belongs to her alone.

In a novel consumed by the uncertainties of science, the flaws of our parents, and enough loss and longing to
line a highway, Sara Shepard is a penetrating chronicler of the adolescence we all carry into adulthood: how
what happens to you as a kid never leaves you, how the fallibility of your parents can make you stronger, and
how being right isn't as important as being wise. From the backwoods of Pennsylvania to the brownstones of
Brooklyn Heights, The Visibles investigates the secrets of the past, and the hidden corners of our own hearts,
to find out whether real happiness is a gift or a choice.
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From reader reviews:

Rebecca Shadwick:

The book The Visibles: A Novel make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your
capable much more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting strain or having big
problem using your subject. If you can make studying a book The Visibles: A Novel for being your habit,
you can get far more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open up and read a publication The Visibles: A Novel.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do
you think about this e-book?

Cassandra Martin:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Visibles: A Novel book
because book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Charles Wagoner:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much easier
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is The Visibles: A Novel this guide consist a lot of the information on the condition of
this world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that
writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some investigation when he makes
this book. That's why this book suited all of you.

Jerry Bonner:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know that
little person like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book. Numerous books
that can you take to be your object. One of them is The Visibles: A Novel.
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