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Can the easy-to-cook, inexpensive, low-fat potato—the ubiquitous "spud"—turn up with chicken and
peanuts as the star of an exotic stir-fry? Can plump baked potatoes, topped with everything from shrimps and
tofu to chicken and chili, win acclaim as delicious one-course meals? Emphatically yes, as these 100-plus
recipes prove.

Barbara Grunes, known nationally for her innovative and nutritionally aware recipes, makes it easy for both
novice and seasoned cooks to transform "bakers," "broilers," red, new, sweet, and every other kind of potato
into imaginative appetizers, hearty soups, exciting stir-frys, 10 different potato salads, a dozen outdoor
barbecues, and delicious side dishes, breads—even desserts.

To "top" it off, Grunes presents no less than 24 luscious, low-fat toppings that recreate baked potatoes as
main-course delights.

Top your "bakers" with Thai shrimp, eggplant Parmesan, ratatouille, Moroccan chicken, turkey chili,
Cantonese stir-fry, Spanakopita, asparagus and mushrooms, tofu Veracruzana, Provencal vegetables,
mushrooms and cheese, and many other ingredients. This book also includes appetizers, soups, salads,
entrees, and side dishes: Vichyssoise, German potato salad, calm chowder, goulash soup, Oriental steamed
potatoes, grilled sweets with pineapple, grilled skins and salsa, Colcannon tandoori kabobs, Cuban mashed
potato pudding, potato biscuits, Bohemian dessert pancakes, potato-zucchini pancakes, and many more!

The most health-happy collection of its kind, these recipes deliver not only the great taste but also the
incredible nutrition of the potato as a low-fat complex carbohydrate that's cholesterol-free and literally
loaded with potassium, vitamin C, and fiber.
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Belcher:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic from the park.
They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill your
current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
test look for book, may be the publication untitled Skinny Potatoes: Over 100 delicious new low-fat recipes
for the world's most versatile vegetable can be very good book to read. May be it is usually best activity to
you.

Wayne Gaddis:

Precisely why? Because this Skinny Potatoes: Over 100 delicious new low-fat recipes for the world's most
versatile vegetable is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the item but
latter it will jolt you with the secret it inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who write the
book in such amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but
still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or
you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such as
help improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold off having that
book? If I had been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Robert Dougherty:

You could spend your free time to read this book this book. This Skinny Potatoes: Over 100 delicious new
low-fat recipes for the world's most versatile vegetable is simple to create you can read it in the playground,
in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the particular printed book, you
can buy typically the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your
smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Ana Vela:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Skinny Potatoes: Over 100 delicious new low-
fat recipes for the world's most versatile vegetable can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book you
know. You are so out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a geek
activity. So what these books have than the others?
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