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Although Jewish participation in German society increased after World War I, Jews did not completely
assimilate into that society. In fact, says Michael Brenner in this intriguing book, the Jewish population of
Weimar Germany became more aware of its Jewishness and created new forms of German-Jewish culture in
literature, music, fine arts, education, and scholarship. Brenner presents the first in-depth study of this
culture, drawing a fascinating portrait of people in the midst of redefining themselves. The Weimar Jews
chose neither a radical break with the past nor a return to the past but instead dressed Jewish traditions in the
garb of modern forms of cultural expression. Brenner describes, for example, how modern translations made
classic Jewish texts accessible, Jewish museums displayed ceremonial artifacts in a secular framework,
musical arrangements transformed synagogue liturgy for concert audiences, and popular novels recalled
aspects of the Jewish past. Brenner's work, while bringing this significant historical period to life, illuminates
contemporary Jewish issues. The preservation and even enhancement of Jewish distinctiveness, combined
with the seemingly successful participation of Jews in a secular, non-Jewish society, offer fresh insight into
modern questions of Jewish existence, identity, and integration into other cultures.
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From reader reviews:

Carl Strum:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important for all of us. The book The Renaissance of Jewish Culture in Weimar Germany
was making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It doesn't
matter what advantages for you. The guide The Renaissance of Jewish Culture in Weimar Germany is not
only giving you much more new information but also being your friend when you sense bored. You can
spend your current spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship while using book The
Renaissance of Jewish Culture in Weimar Germany. You never really feel lose out for everything when you
read some books.

Warner Samuels:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice simply by
surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Sure, by
reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is high. For yourself
who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of The Renaissance of Jewish Culture in Weimar
Germany book as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a
book.

Trina Durham:

Often the book The Renaissance of Jewish Culture in Weimar Germany will bring that you the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the event you try
to find new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book The Renaissance of Jewish Culture
in Weimar Germany is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from the
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

John Hicks:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred to as of
book The Renaissance of Jewish Culture in Weimar Germany. You'll be able to your knowledge by it.
Without leaving the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most
critical that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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