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From America's most trusted kitchens comes a collection of delicious and easy recipes for one-dish meals
that everyone--even the cook--can enjoy.

Featuring:  Kids' Favorites, Easy Entertaining, Tried and True Family Favorites, Brunch Specialties

Convenient casseroles, quick and healthy stir-fries, comfort foods from the slow-cooker: One-dish meals are
perfect for today's busy cook. Pillsbury, America's most trusted name in the kitchen, has collected more than
300 delicious recipes for casseroles, skillet dishes, and slow-cooker meals that everyone--including the cook-
-can enjoy.
        
From Celebration Brunch Strata to Ratatouille with Hot Pepper Tortellini to Old-Fashioned Beef Stew,
Pillsbury: One-Dish Meals Cookbook presents updated family favorites alongside elegant dishes and
exciting new flavors inspired by today's culinary trends.  In addition to its easy-to-follow recipes and more
than 100 beautiful photographs, this latest edition to Pillsbury's library includes step-by-step features
designed to guide readers through specific cooking
techniques.

For the practiced family cook or the culinary novice, this collection of sure-to-please soups, stews,
casseroles, skillet meals and more is a must-have. With their irresistible and infinitely reliable recipes, the
experts at Pillsbury prove that one dish is all today's time-savvy cook needs to make delicious meals.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Tate:

The book Pillsbury: One-Dish Meals Cookbook: More Than 300 Recipes for Casseroles, Skillet Dishes and
Slow-Cooker Meals will bring that you the new experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate
the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to see, this book very appropriate to you. The
book Pillsbury: One-Dish Meals Cookbook: More Than 300 Recipes for Casseroles, Skillet Dishes and
Slow-Cooker Meals is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book through the official
web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Kim Gray:

The actual book Pillsbury: One-Dish Meals Cookbook: More Than 300 Recipes for Casseroles, Skillet
Dishes and Slow-Cooker Meals has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you
can get a lot of help. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research
prior to write this book. This book very easy to read you can find the point easily after scanning this book.

Alberta Keyes:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of the books in the top
listing in your reading list is usually Pillsbury: One-Dish Meals Cookbook: More Than 300 Recipes for
Casseroles, Skillet Dishes and Slow-Cooker Meals. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Mountains
can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking way up and review this book you can get
many advantages.

Sara Matthews:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named of book Pillsbury:
One-Dish Meals Cookbook: More Than 300 Recipes for Casseroles, Skillet Dishes and Slow-Cooker Meals.
You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make
you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one
destination for a other place.
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